










ATTACHMENT B 
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL 

Fairview Corporate Center (Airport Plaza) 
98-DP-024

October 23, 2001 

1. This Final Development Plan is based upon and limited to compliance with the project
description, the hearing exhibits marked Exhibits A-F dated August 15, 2001, and conditions of 
approval set forth below. Any deviations from the project description, exhibits or conditions 
must be reviewed and approved by the Planning Director for conformity with this approval. 
Deviations may require modification to the permit and/or further environmental review. 
Deviations without the above-described approval will constitute a violation of permit approval.

The project description js as follows:

__ __.,, 

The proposed project involves redeveloping the site to complement the renovations that were 
recently made to Building 500. Building 420 (42,930 square feet) is to be demolished and 
replaced with a two-story, 65,600 square foot building in the north central portion of the site 
(Building 1 ). Building 430 (25,250 square feet) is to be demolished and replaced with a two­
story, 62,400 square foot building in the northeastern portion of the site (Building 2). The 
existing (11,000 square foot) dock on the west side of Building 500 will be demolished, and a 
new one-story, 6,000 square foot building (Building 3) will be attached to the west side of 
Building 500. The net increase of the square footage on site is 65,820 square feet, for a total of 
242,000 square feet on site. Buildings 1 and 2 will be approximately 35 feet, which includes the 
equipment screens on the roof. The architectural features (i.e. raised building parapets and 
copper roof features) at the building entries will be approximately 38 feet.

The applicant plans to design the interior improvements to Buildings 1 and 2 to accommodate 
tenants involved in technology, electronic commerce or similar industries; Building 500 will 
continue to house additional operations and personnel of Santa Barbara Bank and Trust. 
Pursuant to the terms of the proposed Development Agreement, the applicant may lease up to 
20% of the total gross floor area to commercial/retail users. The project will require 1,220 cubic 
yards (c.y.) of cut and 10,250 c.y. of fill.

Vehicular access to the center will be provided bya main entry drive from Fairview Avenue on 
the west; a repaved private road or alley (sometimes referred to as Carson Street) that runs 
along the northern edge of the site from Fairview to Magnolia Avenue; and another entry drive 
from the north that in essence will extend Orange A venue into the site. The project will also 
include two foture entry drives from the south along the proposed e:ll..iension of Ekwill Street 
from Pine Avenue to Fairview Avenue. A proposed bus stop (which may take the fom1 of a 
turnout), and shelter will be located along the project frontage on Fairview A venue between the 
main entry drive and the Carson Street entrance, as approved by MTD and County Public 
Works. A series of walkways will provide pedestrian access to the center from both Fairview 
and Orange Avenues, connecting with an internal wall'Way network to Building 500 and each 
of the proposed new structures.

The applicant will reconfigure the existing parking lot to install new landscaping and a total of 
731 parking spaces. The proposed project includes 696 parking spaces that will serve all of the 
buildings in the center, and 35 parking spaces that will be for the exclusive use of the County 
Redevelopment Agency. The Redevelopment Agency parking spaces will be used to satisfy 
parking requirements for future residential or mixed-use projects along the Hollister A venue 
Mixed-Use Corridor. Of the 702,574 square feet onsite, building footprints, covered docks, 
covered patios and covered entries will occupy 181,000 square feet (or 26 percent of the site);
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drives, parking and other paved areas will occupy 318,800 square feet (or 45 percent of the 
site); landscaping on site will occupy 160,012 square feet (or 23 percent of the site); and 
employee patios and other, unspecified "hardscape" will occupy the remaining 42,762 square 
feet ( 6 percent of the site). 

The landscape plan for the project emphasizes a mixture of native and non-native trees and 
shrubs selected for their visual interest and drought tolerance. The planting plan within the 
floodway on the western portion of the site will be consistent with the Flood Control District 
requirements. 

A development agreement (99-0A-006) accompanies the development plan. The Legislature 
of the State of California adopted §65864 et seq. of the Government Code, which authorizes the 
County to enter into an agreement with any person having a legal or equitable interest in real 
property providing for the development of such property and establishing certain development 
rights therein. 

Action KS 10-14 in the Goleta Old Town Revitalization Plan specifies that the County and the 
applicant are to negotiate a Development Agreement for the proposed prqject. TI1e key 
elements of the Agreement include cooperation on location of the Ekwill Street extension, 
overall renovation of Key Site 10, variation from certain applicable development standards, the 
project's contributions toward improvements to the Fairview Avenue corridor, and dedicated 
parking spaces for the County's Redevelopment Agency.1

Water service to the site \Vill continue to be provided by the Goleta Water District and sewer 
will be provided by the Goleta Sanitary District. 

The proposed project does not include signs. A condition of approval requires that the 
applicant gain final Board of Architectural approval for an Overall Sign Plan for the property 
p1ior to building occupancy. 

The project may be developed in either one or two phases. If the project is phased, the phasing 
plan indicates that the first phase will include at a minimum constmction of landscape 
improvements along the full length of the Fairview Avenue frontage within the right-of-way 
and the required buffer area, and the construction of 35 Redevelopment Agency parking spaces 
and construction of either Building 1 or 2·. The 6,000 square foot addition to Building 500 will 
be built in conjunction with either Phase I or Phase II at the discretion of the applicant. See 
Attachment F for the phasing plan. 

Modifications Requested 

As a part of the project, the application is requesting modifications to certain standards of the 
Article III (Inland) Zoning Ordinance as follows: 

1. Section 35.233.13 to allow a reduction in the amount of required landscaping from 30% to
23%;

1 
The June 1998 Goleta Old Town Revitalization Plan identifies South Fairview Beautification as one of a series of public 

improvements designed to improve the identity and visual environment of Old Town village. The project is planned to include 

construction of a Class I bikepath on South Fairview between Hollister and Fowler Road, major landscape improvements (including 

restoration of San Pedro Creek) and frontage improvements (curb, gutter and sidewalks) where appropriate. 














































